
Annex A – E-petition 

Title: Remove the unlawful Gypsy Caravan site from the Noddle Hill Lay-
by 

Statement: 

We the undersigned petition the council to act to remove the unlawful 
Gypsy Caravan site from the Noddle Hill lay-by alongside the A166, a 
main road into the city where this eyesore is in open view. This 
encampment has been in existence in its present location since June 
2019 and has been the subject of many requests to City of York Council 
(CYC) for its removal, all of which have been ignored in favour of CYC 
actively facilitating the ongoing situation by the provision of taxpayer 
funded facilities to the occupiers. The situation continues to be 
unacceptable, Noddle Hill lay-by saw considerable community activity 
some years ago to transform the area with clear up operations and 
extensive tree planting, which is now undermined by CYC’s continued 
acceptance of this encampment. This petition calls upon CYC and North 
Yorkshire Police to use the powers available to them to remove this 
encampment without any further delay. 

Justification: 

The City of York Council (CYC) Housing function continue to ignore 
requests by Parish Councils, residents and Ward Councillors to act in 
this matter, a situation expressly created by the Housing function’s 
actions at the beginning of 2019 by evictions off the Osbaldwick Gypsy 
Caravan Site. 

Despite the welcome attentions of the Safer York Partnership team, the 
CYC Housing officers and responsible Executive Member continue to 
decline to act in the removal of this encampment which is illegally 
blocking the public highway and an unlawful encampment within Green 
Belt land. 

The Housing officers and Executive Member have ignored for the last 
three and a half years requests to meet with the Parish Councils to 
explain this situation. 

This petition seeks to bring this matter fully into the open and make the 
CYC system bring the relevant officers and Executive Member out to 
explain this unacceptable situation in a public forum 



 

Submitted by: Cllr Warters and Cllr Rowley 

Contact details: mark@markwarters.co.uk  cllr.mrowley@york.gov.uk  

This ePetition ran from 16/11/2022 to 31/12/20222 and has now closed. 

51 people signed this ePetition. 

 

ePetition signatures 

Name 
   

Date signed  

Mark Warters    16/11/2022  

Pamela Cockerill    16/11/2022  

Christine Smith    16/11/2022  

Geoffrey Andrews    16/11/2022  

Martin Cockerill    16/11/2022  

Mark Newby    16/11/2022  

Graeme Rudd    16/11/2022  

John Mackfall    16/11/2022  

Gary Wilkins    16/11/2022  

Terry Molloy    16/11/2022  

Peter Clifton    17/11/2022  

Jonathan Kay    17/11/2022  

JOSETTE FARMER    17/11/2022  

Marian Ruston    17/11/2022  

Matt Rounding    17/11/2022  

Sarah Wishart    17/11/2022  

Juliet Pearce    18/11/2022  

Gillian Shaw    18/11/2022  

Linda Molloy    18/11/2022  
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Derek Lee    19/11/2022  

Sandy Nicholson    26/11/2022  

Rita Willis    05/12/2022  

Jack Renwick    05/12/2022  

EDWARD sweeney    05/12/2022  

Paul Bailey    05/12/2022  

Glyn Trotter    05/12/2022  

Emma Wainwright    05/12/2022  

Stephen Ashby    05/12/2022  

Chris Williams    05/12/2022  

Joanne Collins    05/12/2022  

Melanie Williams    05/12/2022  

Jayne Shepherd    05/12/2022  

Allan Haddon    05/12/2022  

Nick Blake    05/12/2022  

Jenny Knight    05/12/2022  

Christine Wilkinson    05/12/2022  

Alex Savage    05/12/2022  

Sylvia Osguthorpe    05/12/2022  

Rachel Robinson    05/12/2022  

Sue Goodwill    05/12/2022  

Matthew Eastwood    05/12/2022  

Stephen Robinson    05/12/2022  

Richard Jenkinson    05/12/2022  

Terence Nicholson    05/12/2022  

Kylie Jackson    05/12/2022  

Jackie Andrews    05/12/2022  

Lynda Haddon    05/12/2022  

Alastair Sommerville    05/12/2022  



Jason Munday    05/12/2022  

Rachel Booth    05/12/2022  

Harvey Booth    05/12/2022  

 


